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Week Ending 08-06-23 

INCIDENTS: 
 

07-31-23 
 

At 0125hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1177 for a report of recovered 
property found at a business on S. Washington St. 
 

At 1142hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1178 for a report of a disabled 
vehicle on N Clay St & Perkins St. 
 

At 1438hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1180 to assist a motorist in 
unlocking their vehicle at a residence on S. Washington St. 
 

At 1649hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1181 for a welfare check at a 
business on S. Washington St. 
 

At 1715hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1182 for a report of a suspicious 
person at a business on E. Jackson St. 
 

At 1730hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1183 for a report of a suspicious 
vehicle on Maxwell Ave. 
 

At 2023hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1184 for a report of assault at a 
business on S. Washington St. 
 

At 2137hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1185 for a report of an alarm at a 
business on Glen Dr. 
 

At 2212hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1186 for a report of a barking dog 
at a residence on Forlow St. 
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At 2307hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1187 for a report of public 
indecency at a business on S. Washington St. 
 

08-01-23 
 

At 1011hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1188 to assist a motorist in 
unlocking their vehicle at a residence on S. Washington St. 
 

At 1106hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1189 for a report of a reckless 
driver at a business on S. Washington St. 
 

At 1204hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1190 for a report of falsification at 
a business on Massillon Rd. 
 

At 1503hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1191 for a report of lost property at 
a business on S. Washington St. 
 

At 2142hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1192 for a report of a reckless 
driver at a business on S. Washington St. 
 

08-02-23 
 

At 0147hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1193 for a report of a juvenile 
problem at a residence on Lakeview Dr. 
 

At 0837hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1194 for a report of a suspicious 
vehicle at a business on S. Washington St. 
 

At 0929hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1195 for a report of a parking 
problem at a business on S. Washington St. 
 

At 0938hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1196 for a report of a break and 
entering at a residence on S. Washington St. 
 

At 0948hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1197 for a report of falsification at 
a business on S. Washington St. 
 

At 1225hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1199 for a report of an obstructed 
roadway on S. Clay St & S. Washington St. 
 

At 1246hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1200 for a report of theft at a 
business on S. Washington St. 
 

At 1253hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1201 for a report of a parking 
problem on S. Alexander St. & Pearl St. 



 

At 1400hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1202 for a 911 hang up at a 
business on Glen Dr. 
 

At 1425hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1203 for a report of a reckless 
driver coming south into the village from SR 241. 
 
At 1714hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1204 for a report of a dog running 
at large on Massillon Rd. 
 
At 2052hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1205 for a report of domestic 
violence at a residence on Lakeview Drive. 
 
At 2103hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1206 for a report of a vehicle 
driving reckless on W. Jackson St. 
 
At 2238hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1207 for a report of noise on S. 
Crawford St. 
 
08-03-23 
 
At 0032hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1208 of domestic violence at a 
residence on Lakeview Drive. 
 
At 0145hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1209 for a report of menacing at a 
residence on Lakeview Drive. 
 
At 1058hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1210 to assist a motorist in 
unlocking their vehicle at a residence on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1604hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1211 for a report of threats at a 
residence on Lakeview Drive. 
 
At 1706hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1212 for a report of a disabled 
vehicle on S. Clay St. 
 
08-04-23 
 
At 1123hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1213 for a funeral escort through 
town to the south limit. 
 
At 1125hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1214 for a report of criminal 
damage at a residence on Lakeview Drive. 
 
At 1718hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1215 for a civil stand by at a 
residence on Elm St. 
 



At 1825hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1216 for a report of a dog running 
at large on E. Jackson St. 
 
 
08-05-23 
 
At 0546hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1217 for a report of an obstructed 
roadway on W Jackson St. 
 
At 1032hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1218 to assist a motorist in 
unlocking their vehicle at a residence on S. Washington St. 
 

08-06-23 
 

At 0204hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1219 for a noise complaint at a 
residence on CR 58. 
 

At 0920hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1220 for a report of breaking and 
entering at a business on S. Washington St. 
 

At1018hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1221 for a report of trespassing at 
a business on W. Jackson St. 
 

At1018hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1222 for a report of trespassing at 
a business on Wooster Rd. 
 

At 1139hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1223 to assist a citizen at a 
residence on Lakeview Dr. 
 

At 1707hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1224 for a report of a parking 
problem at a residence on S. Washington St. 
 

At 1811hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1225 for a report of unauthorized 
use at a residence on S. Washington St. 
 

At 1935hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1226 for a report of an alarm at a 
business on S. Washington St. 
 

At 2047hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1227 for a report of an alarm at a 
business on S. Washington St. 
 
 
 
Accidents: 
 

07-31-23 
 



At 1223hrs this department responded to call 23MPD1179 for a two vehicle non injury 
crash at a business on S. Clay St. 
 

 


