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Week Ending 8-11-24 

INCIDENTS: 
 
8-5-24 
 
At 0535hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1120 to assist a citizen with a complaint 
at a residence on Massillon Rd. 
 
8-6-24 
 
At 0155hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1121 for a suspicious person complaint 
at a business on S Washington St 
 
At 1548hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1122 to check the welfare of a resident 
on Lakeview Drive. 
 
8-7-24 
 
At 0034hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1123 for a reported suspicious person 
on Hebron St. 
 
At 0841hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1124 to perform a welfare check at a 
residence on Massillon Rd. 
 
At 1851hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1125 for an unruly juvenile complaint 
received at the village office on N Washington St. 
 
At 2228hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1126 for a juvenile complaint from a 
business on S Washington St. 
 
 
8-8-24 
 
At 0924hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1127 to assist another agency at the 
courthouse on E Jackson. 
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At 1117hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1128 for an ATV complaint on Glen 
Drive. 
 
At 1130hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1130 for a parking complaint on S Clay 
St. 
 
At 1546hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1131 to assist with a disabled vehicle on 
N Washington street. 
 
At 1616hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1132 for an animal complaint at the park 
on Glen Dr. 
 
8-9-24 
 
At 1307hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1134 for a reported suspicious person 
on Glen Drive. 
 
At 1710hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1136 for a suspicious vehicle complaint 
at a business on S Washington St. 
 
At 1837hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1137 for a criminal damaging complaint 
at a residence on S Washington St. 
 
At 2109hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1138 for a reported protection order 
violation at a business on Glen Dr. 
 
8-10-24 
 
At 0721hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1141 for a reported alarm at a closed 
business on E Clinton St. 
 
At 1142hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1142 for a reported obstructed roadway 
on Fairview Ave. 
 
At 1424hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1143 for a reported disabled vehicle on 
N Washington St. 
 
At 1431hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1144 for a reported disabled vehicle on 
E Jackson St near Lakeview Dr. 
 
At 1458hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1145 for a reckless driver complaint on 
S Washington St. 
 
At 1747hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1146 for a 911-hangup at a residence 
on S Washington St. 
 
At 1834hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1147 for a juvenile complaint at a 
residence on CR 58. 
 
At 2239hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1148 for a reckless driver complaint at a 
business on S Washington St. 
 



   

 

   

 

 
8-11-24 
 
At 1222hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1149 for a report of lost property at a 
business on SR 39; West village limit. 
 
At 1305hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1150 for a reported suspicious person 
at a residence on S Crawford St. 
 
At 1338hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1151 to assist a citizen with a complaint 
at a residence on E Jackson St. 
 
At 1428hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1152 for a trespassing complaint at a 
building on Hebron St. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Accidents: 
 
8-8-24 
 
At 1202hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1129 for a two vehicle non-injury crash 
on S Washington St near Quail St.  A report was filed. 
 
At 1753hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1133 for a two vehicle non-injury crash 
at S Washington and S Clay streets.  A report was filed. 
 
8-9-24 
 
At 1543hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1135 for a two vehicle non-injury crash 
at a business on E Jackson St. 
 
At 2108hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1139 for a vehicle vs. pedestrian injury 
incident on S Washington St near Glen Dr. 
 
8-10-24 
 
At 0541hrs this department responded to call 24MPD1140 for a one vehicle injury crash on E 
Jackson St. 
 


