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Week Ending 05-16-2021 

INCIDENTS: 

05-10-21 
 
At 0754hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0668 for a report of a juvenile 
problem at a residence on CR 58. 
 
At 1944hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0669 for a report of a reckless 
driver on E. Jackson St 
 
05-11-21 
 
At 0828hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0670 to assist a citizen at a 
residence on Massillon Rd. 
 
At 1205hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0671 to assist Holmes Fire District 
#1 with a squad call at a business on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1849hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0672 for reports of junk at a 
residence on S. Crawford St.  
 
05-12-21 
 
At 0251hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0673 to assist the Holmes County 
Sheriff’s office at a residence on PR 343. 
 
At 1530hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0676 for a disabled vehicle near a 
business on S. Washington St. 
 
At 1744hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0677 for reports of junk at a 
residence on E. Jackson St. 
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At 1744hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0678 for reports of junk at a 
residence on S. Mad Anthony St.  
 
At 2022hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0679 for a report of theft at a 
business on SR 39.  
 
At 2245hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0680 for a locked vehicle with the 
keys inside at a business on S. Washington St.  
 
At 2316hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0681 for a suspicious vehicle on S. 
Crawford St.  
 
05-13-21 
 
At 0636hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0682 for an obstruction in the 
roadway on S. Clay St.  
 
At 1357hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0684 to assist Holmes Fire District 
#1 at a residence on S. Washington St.  
 
05-14-21 
 
At 0541hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0685 for a traffic stop on E. 
Jackson St. A citation was issued.  
 
At 1119hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0687 for reports of a disabled 
vehicle on S. Washington St.  
 
At 1410hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0688 for reports of a suspicious 
person on N. Grant St. 
 
At 2014hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0689 to assist an other agencey 
on E. Jackson St. 
 
05-15-21 
 
At 0323hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0692 for a report of noise near a 
residence on Massillon Rd. 
 
At 0444hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0693 to assist a citizen on 
Northern Drive. 
 
At 1232hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0694 for a juvenile problem on E 
Jackson st 
 



At 1810hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0695 for a disturbance at a 
residence on N. Crawford St. 
 
At 2139hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0696 for an animal call at a 
business on SR39. 
 
At 2324hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0697 for a suspicious vehicle off of 
Glen Dr. 
 
05-16-21 
 
At 0023hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0698 to assist the Holmes County 
Sheriffs office on E. Jackson St. 
 
At 1044hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0699 to assist Holmes Fire District 
#1 at a business on S. Washington St.  
 
 
 
 
ACCIDENTS: 
 
05-12-21 
 
At 1102hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0674 for a two vehicle non injury 
crash at a business on S. Washington St.  A report was filed. 
 
At 1256hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0675 for a two vehicle non injury 
crash on N. Washington St.  A report was filed. 
 
05-13-21 
 
At 1035hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0683 for a two vehicle non injury 
accident crash at a business on S. Washington St. A report was filed.  
 
05-14-21 
 
At 0857hrs this department responded to call 21MPD0686 for a two vehicle non injury 
crash at a business on S. Washington St. A report was filed.  


